
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES
TABULATION OF BIDS
2014 Street Sweeping
County:  Cook Date:  February 24, 2014

Time: 10:00am
Section: Appropriation $
Estimate $ Attended by: J. Volpe

Proposal Guarantee: Bid Bond No Bid Bid Bond
Terms:  Street Sweeping Program

Items Delivery Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

April, May, June, July Mile 282 67.50 19,035.00 No Bid 0.00 62.00 17,484.00 0.00
Partial Mile 122 67.50 8,235.00 0.00 62.00 7,564.00 0.00

Aug., Sept., Oct. Mile 282 65.50 18,471.00 0.00 97.00 27,354.00 0.00
Mile 282 105.60 29,779.20 0.00 97.00 27,354.00 0.00

90.00 45.00
123.00 65.00

Minimum number of curb miles charged for "call-in" 10 0

75,520.20 0.00 79,756.00 0.00

2351 Powis Rd
West Chicago
Illinois  60185

Waste Management Illinois Central Hoving Clean Sweep
Sweeping Service
2307 W. 135 Place
Blue Island  60406

Of Illlinois
5050 W Pershing Rd

Cicero, Il 60804

 

2014 Total Bid

Municipality: Hoffman Estates

2014

April, May, June, July
Street Sweeping Program

*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Saturday's 

 

$232,881.90 $243,960.96 $0.00

*Extra Work Not Included in Bid Total

$0.00

Nov., & Dec.

*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Sundays and Holidays

3 Year Total Bid



VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES
TABULATION OF BIDS
2014 Street Sweeping
County:  Cook Date:  February 24, 2014

Time: 10:00am
Section: Appropriation $
Estimate $ Attended by: J. Volpe

Proposal Guarantee: Bid Bond No Bid Bid Bond
Terms:  Street Sweeping Program

Items Delivery Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

April, May, June, July Mile 282 69.40 19,570.80 No Bid 0.00 63.24 17,833.68 0.00
Partial Mile 122 69.40 8,466.80 0.00 63.24 7,715.28 0.00

Aug., Sept., Oct. Mile 282 67.30 18,978.60 0.00 99.00 27,918.00 0.00
Mile 282 108.50 30,597.00 0.00 99.00 27,918.00 0.00

92.50 45.00
126.40 65.00

Minimum number of curb miles charged for "call-in" 10 0

77,613.20 0.00 81,384.96 0.00
$0.00

*Extra Work Not Included in Bid Total

$243,960.96

*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Sundays and Holidays

2015 Total Bid
3 Year Total Bid $232,881.90 $0.00

2015
Street Sweeping Program

April, May, June, July

Nov., & Dec.
*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Saturday's 

Municipality: Hoffman Estates

  

5050 W Pershing Rd 2307 W. 135 Place West Chicago
Cicero, Il 60804 Blue Island  60406 Illinois  60185

Waste Management Illinois Central Hoving Clean Sweep
Of Illlinois Sweeping Service 2351 Powis Rd



VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES
TABULATION OF BIDS
2014 Street Sweeping
County:  Cook Date:  February 24, 2014

Time: 10:00am
Section: Appropriation $
Estimate $ Attended by: J. Volpe

Proposal Guarantee: Bid Bond No Bid Bid Bond
Terms:  Street Sweeping Program

Items Delivery Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

April, May, June, July Mile 282 71.30 20,106.60 No Bid 0.00 64.00 18,048.00
Partial Mile 122 71.30 8,698.60 0.00 64.00 7,808.00

Aug., Sept., Oct. Mile 282 69.15 19,500.30 0.00 101.00 28,482.00
Mile 282 111.50 31,443.00 0.00 101.00 28,482.00

95.00 45.00
130.00 65.00

Minimum number of curb miles charged for "call-in" 10 0 0.00

79,748.50 0.00 82,820.00 0.00
$0.00

*Extra Work Not Included in Bid Total

$243,960.96

*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Sundays and Holidays

2016 Total Bid
3 Year Total Bid $232,881.90 $0.00

2016
Street Sweeping Program

April, May, June, July

Nov., & Dec.
*Extra Work: Cost per curb mile call in Saturday's 

Municipality: Hoffman Estates

  

5050 W Pershing Rd 2307 W. 135 Place West Chicago
Cicero, Il 60804 Blue Island  60406 Illinois  60185

Waste Management Illinois Central Hoving Clean Sweep
Of Illlinois Sweeping Service 2351 Powis Rd
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