



STATE OF ILLINOIS  
 VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
 2020 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
 TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook		Date: 1/30/2020	
Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates		Time: 10:00 a.m.	
Section:		Appropriation \$	
Estimate \$		Attended by: Nick Lackowski	
Proposal Guarantee:			
2020 Bid Season			
2020 Proposed Cost:		Ornamental Trees	
COMPANY	QUANTITY	Unit Price	Total
Acer latanicum - Tartarian Maple	5-10	\$289.00	2,890.00
Acer campestre - Hedge Maple	0-10	\$260.00	2,600.00
Acer ginnala - Amur Maple Tree Form	0-10	\$290.00	2,900.00
Amelanchier - Serviceberry Tree Form	5-15	\$315.00	4,725.00
Cercis canadensis- Eastern Redbud	0-10	\$315.00	3,150.00
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Spring Snow'	0-10	\$300.00	3,000.00
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Red Baron'	0-10	\$295.00	2,950.00
Crataegus Crus-Gnli Inermis-Thornless Cockspur Hawthorn	0-10	\$320.00	3,200.00
Syringa reticulata - Japanese Tree Lilac 'Ivory Silk'	15-25	\$325.00	8,125.00
Magnolia acuminata - Cucumber Magnolia	5-10	\$320.00	3,200.00
<b>Total Bid</b>		\$39,740.00	\$49,310.00

St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Unit Price	Total
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$8,375.00
		\$443.50	\$4,435.00
		\$393.50	\$3,935.00
		NO BID	\$0.00
		\$397.44	\$3,974.40
		\$428.19	\$4,281.90
		\$482.88	\$12,072.00
		\$466.37	\$4,663.70
		\$48,893.25	

Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Unit Price	Total
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$4,250.00
		\$425.00	\$8,375.00
		\$443.50	\$4,435.00
		\$393.50	\$3,935.00
		NO BID	\$0.00
		\$397.44	\$3,974.40
		\$428.19	\$4,281.90
		\$482.88	\$12,072.00
		\$466.37	\$4,663.70
		\$48,893.25	

Apex Landscaping Inc.Hawthorn Woods II.		Unit Price	Total
		NO BID	\$0.00
		\$466.50	\$4,665.00
		\$435.50	\$4,355.00
		\$440.75	\$6,611.25
		\$443.50	\$4,435.00
		\$393.50	\$3,935.00
		NO BID	\$0.00
		\$397.44	\$3,974.40
		\$428.19	\$4,281.90
		\$482.88	\$12,072.00
		\$466.37	\$4,663.70
		\$48,893.25	

STATE OF ILLINOIS  
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
2020 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates Section: Estimate \$ Proposal Guarantee: 2020 Bid Season	Date: 1/30/2020 Time: 10:00 a.m. Appropriation \$ Attended by: Nick Lackowski	2020 Proposed Cost:	Evergreens & Shrubs	Company	St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Apex Landscaping Inc. Hawthorn Woods II.	
					QUANTITY	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price
			Thuja occidentalis - Arborvitae 'Techny' or 'Pyramidal American'	0-10	\$225.00	\$2,250.00	\$180.00	\$1,800.00	\$362.25	\$3,622.50
			Picea pungens - Colorado Blue Spruce 'Hoops'	0-3	\$240.00	\$720.00	\$425.00	\$1,275.00	\$519.75	\$1,559.25
			Euonymus alatus - Burning Bush 'Rudy Haag' or 'True Dwarf'	0-10	\$35.00	\$350.00	\$36.00	\$360.00	\$98.31	\$983.10
			Spiraea japonica - Spiraea 'Shirobana' or 'Little Princess'	0-6	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$101.20	\$607.20
			Syringa meyeri - Dwarf Korean Lilac	0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$101.20	\$607.20
			Syringa pubescens subsp. Patula - Dwarf Lilac 'Miss Kim'	0-10	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$43.00	\$430.00	\$101.20	\$1,012.00
			Viburnum dentatum - Arrowwood Viburnum 'Autumn Jazz' or 'Chicago Lusture'	0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$93.08	\$558.36
			Taxus media - Japanese Yew (low growing variety)	0-15	\$49.00	\$735.00	\$67.00	\$1,005.00	\$121.68	\$1,825.20
			Buxus microphylla - Boxwood 'Wintergreen' or 'Green Velvet'	0-25	\$60.00	\$1,500.00	\$146.00	\$3,650.00	\$112.75	\$2,818.75
			Ribes Alpinum - Alpine Currant	0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$43.00	\$215.00	\$99.10	\$495.50
			Cornus sericea - Dogwood 'Isanti' or 'Alleman's Compact'	0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$43.00	\$215.00	\$95.43	\$477.15
			<b>Total Bid</b>			<b>\$7,235.00</b>		<b>\$9,724.00</b>		<b>\$14,566.21</b>

<b>2019 Cumulative Bid</b>	<b>\$197,735.00</b>	<b>\$280,434.00</b>	<b>\$292,675.31</b>
----------------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------



STATE OF ILLINOIS  
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
2021 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates Section: Estimate \$ Proposal Guarantee: 2021 Alternate Bid Season	Date: 1/30/2020 Time: 10:00 a.m. Appropriation \$ Attended by: Nick Lackowski	COMPANY	St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Apex Landscaping Inc.Hawthorn Woods II.	
			QUANTITY	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Total
2021 Proposed Cost: Ornamental Trees								
Acer lauratum - Tartarian Maple		5-10	\$299.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	NO BID	\$0.00	
Acer campestre - Hedge Maple		0-10	\$275.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$481.07	\$4,610.70	
Acer ginnala - Amur Maple Tree Form		0-10	\$290.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$439.86	\$4,398.60	
Amelanchier - Serviceberry Tree Form		5-15	\$325.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$445.16	\$6,677.40	
Cercis canadensis- Eastern Redbud		0-10	\$335.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$447.94	\$4,479.40	
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Spring Snow'		0-10	\$300.00	\$259.00	\$259.00	\$397.44	\$3,974.40	
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Red Baron'		0-10	\$295.00	\$259.00	\$259.00	\$397.44	\$3,974.40	
Crataegus Crus-Gnll Inermis- Thornless Cocksaur Hawthorn		0-10	\$320.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$428.19	\$4,281.90	
Syringa reticulata - Japanese Tree Lilac 'Ivory Silk'		15-25	\$325.00	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$492.88	\$12,322.00	
Magnolia acuminata - Cucumber Magnolia		5-10	\$320.00	\$495.00	\$495.00	\$468.37	\$4,663.70	
<b>Total Bid</b>			\$40,340.00	\$49,310.00		\$49,382.50		

STATE OF ILLINOIS  
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
2021 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates Section: Estimate \$ Proposal Guarantee: 2021 Alternate Bid Season	Date: 1/30/2020 Time: 10:00 a.m. Appropriation \$ Attended by: Nick Lackowski	Company	QUANTITY	St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Apex Landscaping Inc. Hawthorn Woods II.	
				Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
2021 Proposed Cost:	Evergreens & Shrubs								
Thuja occidentalis - Arborvitae	Tectony or Pyramidal American		0-10	\$225.00	\$2,250.00	\$180.00	\$1,800.00	\$365.87	\$3,658.70
Picea pungens - Colorado Blue Spruce	'Hoopsi'		0-3	\$240.00	\$720.00	\$425.00	\$1,275.00	\$524.95	\$1,574.85
Euonymus alatus - Burning Bush	'Rudy Haag' or 'True Dwarf'		0-10	\$35.00	\$350.00	\$36.00	\$360.00	\$99.30	\$993.00
Spiraea japonica - Spiraea	'Shirobana' or 'Little Princess'		0-6	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$102.21	\$613.26
Syringa meyeri - Dwarf Korean Lilac			0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$102.21	\$613.26
Syringa pubescens subsp. Palula - Dwarf Lilac	'Miss Kim'		0-10	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$43.00	\$430.00	\$102.21	\$1,022.10
Viburnum dentatum - Arrowwood	Viburnum 'Autumn Jazz' or 'Chicago Lusture'		0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$43.00	\$258.00	\$93.99	\$563.94
Taxus media - Japanese Yew (low growing variety)			0-15	\$49.00	\$735.00	\$67.00	\$1,005.00	\$122.64	\$1,842.60
Buxus microphylla - Boxwood	'Wintergreen' or 'Green Velvet'		0-25	\$60.00	\$1,500.00	\$146.00	\$3,650.00	\$113.88	\$2,847.00
Ribes alpinum - Alpine Currant			0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$43.00	\$215.00	\$100.09	\$500.45
Cornus sericea - Dogwood	'Isanti' or 'Alleman's Compact'		0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$43.00	\$215.00	\$96.38	\$481.90
	<b>Total Bid</b>				<b>\$7,235.00</b>		<b>\$9,724.00</b>		<b>\$14,711.06</b>
				<b>2019 Cumulative Bid</b>	<b>\$203,185.00</b>	<b>\$280,434.00</b>	<b>\$294,529.16</b>		



STATE OF ILLINOIS  
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
2022 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates Section: Estimate \$ Proposal Guarantee: 2022 Alternate Bid Season	Date: 1/30/2020 Time: 10:00 a.m. Appropriation \$ Attended by: Nick Lackowski	COMPANY	QUANTITY	St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Apex Landscaping Inc. Hawthorn Woods II.	
				Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
2022 Proposed Cost: Ornamental Trees									
Acer tataricum - Tartarian Maple			5-10	\$309.00	3,090.00	\$438.00	\$4,380.00	NO BID	\$0.00
Acer campestre - Hedge Maple			0-10	\$299.00	2,990.00	\$438.00	\$4,380.00	\$465.68	\$4,656.80
Acer ginnala - Amur Maple Tree Form			0-10	\$300.00	3,000.00	\$438.00	\$4,380.00	\$444.25	\$4,442.50
Amelanchier - Serviceberry Tree Form			5-15	\$325.00	4,875.00	\$438.00	\$6,570.00	\$449.61	\$6,744.15
Cercis canadensis - Eastern Redbud			0-10	\$335.00	3,350.00	\$438.00	\$4,380.00	\$452.41	\$4,524.10
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Spring Snow'			0-10	\$300.00	3,000.00	\$268.00	\$2,680.00	\$401.41	\$4,014.10
Malus Species - Ornamental Crabapple 'Red Baron'			0-10	\$295.00	2,950.00	\$268.00	\$2,680.00	\$401.41	\$4,014.10
Crataegus Crus-Gnii Inermis-Thornless Cockspur Hawthorn			0-10	\$330.00	3,300.00	\$438.00	\$10,950.00	\$432.47	\$4,324.70
Syringa reticulata - Japanese Tree Lilac 'Ivory Silk'			15-25	\$335.00	8,375.00	\$438.00	\$10,950.00	\$497.81	\$12,445.25
Magnolia acuminata - Cucumber Magnolia			5-10	\$330.00	3,300.00	\$510.00	\$5,100.00	\$471.03	\$4,710.30
Total Bid					\$41,230.00		\$50,880.00		\$49,876.00



STATE OF ILLINOIS  
VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
2022 Parkway Tree Planting Program  
TABULATION OF BIDS

County: Cook Municipality or Road District: Hoffman Estates Section: Estimate \$ Proposal Guarantee: 2022 Alternate Bid Season	Date: 1/30/2020 Time: 10:00 a.m. Appropriation \$ Attended by: Nick Lackowski	Company	QUANTITY	St Aubin Nursery Kirkland II		Beary Landscape Management Des Plaines II		Apex Landscaping Inc. Hawthorn Woods II.	
				Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
2022 Proposed Cost:	Evergreens & Shrubs								
	Thuja occidentalis - Arborvitae		0-10	\$235.00	\$2,350.00	\$185.00	\$1,850.00	\$369.53	\$3,695.30
	Picea pungens - Colorado Blue Spruce 'Hoopsi'		0-3	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$498.00	\$1,314.00	\$530.20	\$1,590.60
	Euonymus alatus - Burning Bush 'Rudy Haag' or 'True Dwarf'		0-10	\$35.00	\$350.00	\$37.00	\$370.00	\$100.29	\$1,002.90
	Spiraea japonica - Spirea 'Shirobana' or 'Little Princess'		0-8	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$44.00	\$284.00	\$103.23	\$619.38
	Syringa meyeri - Dwarf Korean Lilac		0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$44.00	\$264.00	\$103.23	\$619.38
	Syringa pubescens subsp. Patula - Dwarf Lilac 'Miss Kim'		0-10	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$44.00	\$440.00	\$103.23	\$1,032.30
	Viburnum dentatum - Arrowwood Viburnum 'Autumn Jazz' or 'Chicago Lusture'		0-6	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$44.00	\$264.00	\$94.93	\$569.58
	Taxus media - Japanese Yew (low growing variety)		0-15	\$49.00	\$735.00	\$69.00	\$1,035.00	\$124.12	\$1,861.80
	Buxus microphylla - Boxwood 'Wintergreen' or 'Green Velvet'		0-25	\$60.00	\$1,500.00	\$150.00	\$3,750.00	\$115.02	\$2,875.50
	Ribes alpinum - Alpine Currant		0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$44.00	\$220.00	\$101.09	\$505.45
	Cornus sericea - Dogwood 'Isanit' or 'Alleman's Compact'		0-5	\$45.00	\$225.00	\$44.00	\$220.00	\$97.34	\$486.70
	<b>Total Bid</b>				<b>\$7,365.00</b>		<b>\$9,991.00</b>		<b>\$14,858.89</b>
	<b>2018 Cumulative Bid</b>				<b>\$207,630.00</b>		<b>\$288,981.00</b>		<b>\$297,226.09</b>