

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES
 DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
 TABULATION OF BIDS FOR 3
 FRONT END LOADER RENTALS

Bid Opening Date: October 11, 2018
 Time: 10:00 a.m.
 Attended by: Bev Romanoff, Kelly Keir

Bid Deposit: None Required
 Amount of Deposit Received:
 Bid Certification Form Notarized:
 Substance Abuse Prevention Certificate:
 References Provided:

Name:		Alta Equipment Co		Illinois Truck & Equip		Herc Rentals		McCann	
Address:		2500 Westward Dr #2 Spring Grove, IL 60081 (708) 237-2950		320 Briscoe Dr Morris, IL 60450 (815) 941-1900		4039 S. Peoria St Chicago, IL 60609 (773) 431-5785		543 S. Rohlwing Rd Addison, IL 60101 (630) 774-8830	
E-mail:		Steve Ames		Steve Bernhard		Jason Oosterbeek		Dennis Tovars	
Contact:									
		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price	
		Total		Total		Total		Total	
Tractor Manufacturer		Volvo		Kawasaki		Case or John Deere			
Manufacturer Model		L60		70Z-7		821 F		644k	
Model Year		2015-2019		2015		2014 or newer			
Proposal 1 of 3									
Rental Cost for December 2018		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for January 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for February 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for March 2019		\$2,995.00	\$11,980.00	\$4,950.00	\$19,800.00	\$7,107.00	\$26,607.00		No Bid
Proposal 2 of 3									
Rental Cost for December 2018		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for January 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for February 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for March 2019		\$2,995.00	\$11,980.00	\$4,950.00	\$19,800.00	\$7,107.00	\$26,607.00		No Bid
Proposal 3 of 3									
Rental Cost for December 2018		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for January 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for February 2019		\$2,995.00		\$4,950.00		\$6,500.00			
Rental Cost for March 2019		\$2,995.00	\$11,980.00	\$4,950.00	\$19,800.00	\$7,107.00	\$26,607.00		No Bid
Constant with all Proposals									
Maximum Rental Hours per Month (incl within monthly rental)		80		176		176			
Hourly Rental Cost Beyond Monthly Max.		\$42.79		\$28.12		\$36.94			
Are Rental Hours Accumulative Over a Four Month Period		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Delivery Charge (if applicable) X 3 pieces		\$300.00	\$900.00	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$150.00	\$450.00		
Pick-up Charge (if applicable) X 3 pieces		\$300.00	\$900.00	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$150.00	\$450.00		
Additional Charges (identify)									
Total Bid		\$37,740.00		\$61,800.00		\$80,721.00		No Bid	